


Laura Winters <lwinters@lakewoodpiners.org>

Friday, July 12, 2019 2:56 PM

lamont.Repollet@doe.state.nj.us; lamont.repollet@doe.nj.gov

Leona, Helene; helene.leona@doe.state.nj.us; Forney, Glenn; Glenn Forney, Robert
Finger; David Shafter; Michael Inzelbuch; Moshe Bender

Subject: Re: Please see attached. Thank you!

Attachments: Commissioner Repollet - Request for Files July 12 2019.pdf;, Summary of Lakewood
Public School District Settlement Agreement for Disenrolled Students.” pdf

See attachments.

Thank you.

Respectfuily,

Laura A, Winters
Superintendent of Schools
732-905-3633

Work hard in Silence....And Let Success Make the Noise!
Never Decrease the Goal, Increase the Effort!

"I is easier to build strong children than it is to repair broken men.”
-Frederick Douglass

Success is the result of perfection, hard work, learning from failure, loyalty, and persistence. - Colin Powell

On Fri, Jul 12, 2019 at 2:48 PM Laura Winters <lwinters@lakewoodpiners.org> wrote:
Good Afternoon,

Please see attached.

Thank you!

Respectfully,

Laura A. Winters
Superintendent of Schools
732-905-3633

Work hard in Silence....And Let Success Make the Noise!
Never Decrease the Geal, Increase the Effort!




“It is easier to-build s'trong childran than it is to repair broken men.”
-Frederick Douglass

Success Is the resuit of perfection, hard work, learning from failuse, Joyalty, and persistence, - Colin Powell



Lakewood Board of Education
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Laura A. Winters, Superintendent of Schools Robert Finger, Interim Business Administrator

July 12,2019

Commissioner L. Repollet

New Jersey Department of Education
100 River View Plaza

PO Box 500

Trenton, NJ 08625

RE: Lakewood School District- Request for Files (Summary of Lakewood Public Schools
Disenrolied Students)

Dear Commissioner Repollet:
I hope all is well!

Once again, 1 was hoping you could assist the Lakewood School District, as we have been
trying to seek answers from the New Jersey Department of Education; however, all attempts
sought have been unsuccessful.

Attached you will find two pages presented during court, and never discussed with the
Lakewood School District, titled “Summary of Lakewood Public School District Settlement
Agreement for Disenrolled Students.”

The District has been informed that Ms. Catherine Anthony of the NJDOE, under the direction
of her Supervisor, Dominic Rota, created the list,

In the District’s effort to do its due diligence, and verify all students, and the information
provided, 1 am hereby requesting the following:

+ A copy of all files on the attached NJDOE maintained list title, “Summary of Lakewood
Public School District Settlement Agreement for Disenrolled Students.”

+ The “Exact” method in which was used to determine the cost of each student’s
agreement to the District, as Ms. Anthony was unsure as to what determines the length
of an ESY program. For example on the chart it states 1 +2 ESY, please clarify as to
what that means specifically, and how it effects the cost of each students agreement.

oy l p age



Lakewood Board of Education
200 Ramsey Avenue, Lakewood, NJ 08701 Main Office: (732) 364-2400 Fax: (732) 905-3687
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Laura A, Winters, Superintendent of Schools Robert Finger, Interim Business Admiuistrator

T would also like to note, that nowhere in the chart does it note the cost savings to the District,
and the fact that the State Monitor approved all of the agreements.

As always, | appreciate your assistance!

Thank you!

Respectfully,

Laura A. Winters
Superintendent of Schools

c

Robert Finger, Interim Business Administrator
Moshe Bender, Board President

Glenn Forney, Deputy Commissioner of Education
David Shafter, State Monitor

General Counsel Michael 1. Inzelbuch, Esquire

Attachment; Summary of Lakewood Public School District Settlement Agreement for
Disenrolled Students (Two (2} pages).
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5/23/2013

Hil

2012-17699 5/1/2012 Disenrolled 3 $53,560,00
2015-22082] 9/21/2016| 10/12/2016 Disenrolled 1+2ESY $96,820.00
S015-22228|  9/21/2016] 10/12/2016]  Disenrolled 142 ESY $117,108.00
2015.22231]  9/21/2016| 10/12/2016 Disenrolled 1+ 2 ESY $288,536.00
2015-22232|  9/21/2016 10/12/2016 Disenrolied 142 ESY $86,851.00
7015-22233|  9/21/2016| 10/12/2016 Disenrolled 1+2ESY| $129,800.00
T 2015:22334|  9/21/2016 10/12/2016] _ Disenrolled| 1+2ESY . $83,040,00
2015-22942 and I o > ‘
S015-22280| 972172016 10/12/2016]  Disenrolled 1+2 ESY $113,160.00
2015-227221|  9/21/2016] 10/12/2016} Disenrolled 1+ 2 ESY} ~ $140,120.00
2015-22304|  9/21/2016] 10/12/2016]  Disenrolled RS R 681380001 T
7015-22081] . 10/13/2016} 10/27/2016 Disenrolled 1+ 2 ESY $149,890:.00
2015-22379]  10/13/2016| 10/31/2016 Disenrolled 1+2ESY|, $56,280.00
2015-23017 Unknown|  5/2/2016) Disanrolied] 1 $35,000.00
7015-217811  9/21/2016 9/29/2016| Disenrolled i+ 2 ESY $129,380.00
O015.21980|  6/18/2015|  7/8/2015] _Disenrolied g Unknown
2015-22999]  2/17/2016| 3/14/2016 Disenrolied 1 $68,786.00
01522978|  12/16/2015]  1/8/2016] ~Disenrolled 1,5 4$46,364.00
5015.29367|  6/16/2016] . 3/23/2016| _ Disenrolled 2 $101,000.00
5015.22365|  4/13/2016] 4/21/2016]  Disenrolied ! -$70,000.00
2015-22075]  6/29/2016 7/13/2016] . Disenrolled 142 ESY $85,520.00
5015-21714] . 9/21/2016] 10/31/2016| _ Disenrolled A $160,766.00
201522222 and o ) ‘ -
201522976 9/21/2016{ 11/3/2016| . Disenrolled 2 . $185,978,00
2015-21780]  6/29/2016 7/13/2016]  Disenrolled 1+2ESY $84,120.00
7016-24219]  8/24/2016] . 9/8/2016 Disenrolled 1 $17,500.00
2016-23785]  2/17/2016| 2/26/2016 ‘Diseprolled 2 $127,000.00
7016-23827 and| - 4
| 2016-23893] © 3/16/2016| 3/22/2016 Disenrolled 2 $38,610.00
2016-24791] 12/14/2016] 12/23/2016 Disenrolled 1 $86,387.00
2017-25897 5/8/2017] _ 6/2/2017| _ Disenrolled 2 $202,880.00
5017-25042]  9/21/2016| 11/1/2016 Disenrolled 2 $137,800.00
Th01725174]  3/15/2017| - 4/6/2017| Disenrolled 2| $113,175.00]
S017-256001  3/15/2017]  4/6/2017|  Disenrolled 2 $87,600.00| .
5017.25638]  4/26/2017| 5/10/2017]  Disenrolled ' 2 $73,060.00
301725703 6/27/2017| _6/30/2017| _ Disenrolled 3 $58,500.00
2017-25851 5/8/2017|  6/16/2017 Disenrolled Tl $148,866,00]
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_Disenrolied

2017-25897 5/8/2017|  6/2/2017 2 $124,000.00
2017-25934]  4/26/2017| . 6/7/2017 Disetirolled 2l $85,000.00
2017-25035|  4/26/2017|  5/4/2017 Disenrotled 2 $53,000.00
2017-25972 6/19/2017| 6/23/2017 Disenrolied 2 $88,000.00
S017-25578|  6/19/2017| 6/23/2017|  Disenrolled 3 " $162,400.00
. 2017-25982 6/19/2017| 6/23/2017|  Disenrolied 3 $110,600.00
2017-25990 6/19/2017| 6/23/2017]  Disenrolled 3 '$238,398.00
2017-26086 6/19/2017| - 6/23/2017 Disenrolied 2 $128,500.00
2017-26008  6/19/2017] _6/23/2017 Disenrolled '3 $142,500.00
2017-26120]  6/27/2017| _6/30/2017 Disenrotled 3 $221,820.00
2017-26145 6/19/2017| 6/23/2017 Disenrolled -3 . $204,450.00
2017-26151]  6/19/2017| 6/23/2017 Disenrolled 3| $132,000.00
2017-26204 6/19/2017| . 6/23/2017|  Disenrolied 3 $302,976.00
12017-26206 6/19/2017| 6/23/2017 Disenrolled| .3 $147,920.00
2017-26208] . 6/19/2017| 6/23/2017 Disenrolled 3 - $206,800.00
2017-26225] - 6/19/2017]  6/23/2017 Disenrolled 3 $253,740.00
2017-26236 6/27/2017] 6/30/2017] " Disenrofled 3 $195,950,00
2017-26418]  6/27/2017| 6/30/2017 Disenrolled 3 $161,000.00
D017-26446]  7/19/2017]  8/4/2017 Disenrolled 3 $105,000.00
S018-26963| 10/18/2017| 10/26/2017 " Disenrolled| 20 $12,000.00
T3018-27011 T 0f18/2017| 10/26/2017| “Disenrolled] = il " §A0,000,00
201827012 10/18/2017| 10/26/2017 Disenrolled 1 '$40,000.00
2018-26647| - 8/9/2017 9/6/2017|  Disenrolled 2 $95,500.00
2018-26710} 8/9/2017] 8/22/2017| _Disenrolled 3 $112,500.00
5018-26734] - 8/9/2017| 8/22/2017 Disenrolled 3l "$112,500.00
2018-26742 8/9/2017| 8/22/2017|  Disenrolled 2 $118,500.00

" 2018-26743 8/9/2017| 8/22/2017]  Disenrolled -3 $114,000.00
2018-26760 8/o/2017| 8/22/2017{  Disentolied 31 $133,500.00
2018-26761 8/9/2017) 8/22/2017 Disenrolled B $201,390.00
S018.26895|  9/25/2017| 9/29/2017| _ Disenrolied 2 . $284,960.00
018.26896]  9/25/2017| 9/29/2017| _ Disenrolled 3 $343,980,00
2018-27545 3/28/2018] 4/11/2018| Disenrolied 3 $234,000.00
2018-28321 8/29/2018| 9/10/2018} _ Diseniolled 2 $175,340.00
7018-28322]  8/29/2018| 9/10/2018 Disenrolled 2 $223,180.00
2018-28369]  8/29/2018] 9/10/2018 Disenrolled 2 $200,580.00
2019-28460 8/29/2018] - 9/17/2018 Disenrolled 2| $171,200.00
2019-28542] . 8/29/2018]. 9/7/2018 Disanrolled 2 $138,680.00

© 2019-28473, 8/29/2018] 9/10/2018 Disenrolled 2 - $288,960.00
2019-28474]  8/29/2018| 9/10/2018 “Disenrolied] 2 $243,840,00
2019-28759]  10/24/2018 11/13/2018|  Disenrolled 2 $160,800.00
5019.28763|  10/24/2018| '11/13/2018| Disenrolied 2 $114,720.00
TTo019.28764]  10/24/2018] 11/13/2018|  Disenrolled 2 $102,240.00}

$10,176,771.00
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